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Abstract 
This	research	aims	to	examine	the	application	of	Shariah	
Enterprise	Theory	in	corporate	social	responsibility	(CSR)	
disclosure	 as	 a	 foundation	 for	 realizing	 sustainability	
reporting.	This	study	adopts	a	qualitative	approach	and	
utilizes	 secondary	 data	 sourced	 from	 a	 collection	 of	
relevant	 journal	 articles.	 Shariah	 Enterprise	 Theory	 is	
based	on	the	premise	that	corporate	social	responsibility	
is	 not	 limited	 to	 certain	 individuals	 or	 groups	 but	 also	
entails	accountability	to	Allah	SWT	as	the	ultimate	owner.	
The	theory	emphasizes	 that	corporate	concern	extends	
beyond	the	interests	of	shareholders	to	include	broader	
stakeholders—namely	God,	humanity,	and	nature.	Allah	is	
regarded	 as	 the	 supreme	 authority	 and	 the	 ultimate	
objective	 of	 human	 life,	 thus	 positioned	 as	 the	 highest	
stakeholder.	The	concept	of	sustainability	reporting	and	
Shariah-based	accounting	has	emerged	from	the	growing	
commitment	among	economic	organizations	to	enhance	
ethical	 accountability.	 This	 is	 achieved	 by	 integrating	
environmental,	social,	and	governance	(ESG)	dimensions	
alongside	 financial	considerations.	CSR	reporting,	when	
aligned	with	 sustainability	principles,	 is	 designed	 to	be	
continuous	 in	 nature—produced	 in	 the	 form	 of	
sustainability	 reports.	 These	 reports	 must	 adhere	 to	
standardized	guidelines	to	ensure	they	effectively	convey	
information	on	a	company's	CSR	initiatives	and	impacts.	
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Introduction		

The	 International	 Financial	 Reporting	 Standards	 (IFRS),	 formulated	 by	 the	
International	 Accounting	 Standards	 Board	 (IASB),	 are	 a	 recent	 development	 in	
modern	 accounting	 standards	 that	 aim	 to	 support	 the	 internationalization	 and	
harmonization	of	financial	reporting.	Many	countries	that	previously	adhered	to	the	
Generally	 Accepted	 Accounting	 Principles	 (GAAP),	 developed	 by	 the	 U.S.-based	
Financial	Accounting	Standards	Board	(FASB),	are	now	transitioning	toward	IFRS.	
This	shift	is	largely	due	to	GAAP’s	limitations	in	addressing	the	increasing	plurality	
of	global	society	and	the	rapid	pace	of	contemporary	business.	In	contrast,	IFRS	is	
viewed	 as	 a	 framework	 capable	 of	 strengthening	 global	 financial	 architecture,	
enhancing	 transparency	 in	 financial	 information,	 and	 promoting	 efficiency	 in	
financial	reporting	amid	complex	business	developments	(Putra	et	al.,	2019).	

Over	time,	however,	both	GAAP	and	IFRS—grounded	in	proprietary	theory	and	
entity	theory—have	shown	a	tendency	to	reflect	the	values	of	profit-maximizing	
capitalism.	This	orientation	limits	their	capacity	to	represent	non-economic	realities	
created	by	 firms,	as	 they	predominantly	recognize	quantifiable	economic	events	
(Nursanty	 et	 al.,	 2023).	 Consequently,	 these	 standards	 produce	 financial	
information	 that	 centers	 on	 shareholders	 while	 neglecting	 broader	 social	 and	
environmental	considerations.	

Entity	theory	emerged	to	address	the	shortcomings	of	proprietary	theory	by	
emphasizing	the	legal	and	operational	independence	of	a	company	from	its	owners.	
It	 extends	 beyond	 the	 basic	 ‘accounting	 entity	 assumption’	 by	 reinforcing	 the	
separation	between	business	and	personal	affairs	and	underscoring	accountability	
to	shareholders	(Aksan	et	al.,	2019).	Nevertheless,	this	approach	often	leads	to	the	
production	of	accounting	information	that	is	egoistically	biased.	The	egoistic	nature	
of	this	theory	permeates	users'	decision-making,	fostering	a	self-serving	orientation	
that	prioritizes	profit	without	due	regard	for	other	stakeholders	or	ethical	concerns	
(Triyuwono,	2003).	

Given	its	limitations,	entity	theory	is	considered	less	aligned	with	the	objectives	
of	 Islamic	 business	 ethics.	 In	 this	 context,	 enterprise	 theory	 is	 seen	 as	 a	 more	
appropriate	alternative,	as	it	diminishes	egoism	and	reallocates	economic	power	
among	 various	 stakeholders—including	 customers,	 creditors,	 management,	
suppliers,	 and	 government	 actors.	 Of	 the	 three	 frameworks,	 enterprise	 theory	
exhibits	 a	 stronger	 orientation	 toward	 social	 responsibility	 and	 broader	
accountability.	However,	it	still	falls	short	in	fully	addressing	Shariah	principles	of	
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accountability	and	compliance.	To	resolve	this,	Triyuwono	(2003)	introduced	the	
Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	(SET),	a	 framework	rooted	 in	the	metaphor	of	zakat,	
which	 emphasizes	 balance	 between	 opposing	 values.	 Specifically,	 SET	 aims	 to	
harmonize	masculine	values	(egoism,	materiality)	with	feminine	values	(altruism,	
spirituality),	reflecting	the	holistic	ethos	of	Islamic	accounting.	

In	 idealistic	 Shariah	 accounting,	 adopting	 SET	 as	 a	 foundational	 theory	
influences	both	transaction	recording	and	accountability	in	financial	reporting.	This	
model	demands	a	comprehensive	balance	among	financial,	social,	environmental,	
material,	and	spiritual	dimensions.	It	requires	adherence	to	halal-thayyib	principles,	
the	 exclusion	 of	 usury,	 and	 the	 integration	 of	 both	 quantitative	 and	 qualitative	
reporting	(Hermawan	&	Rini,	2018).	Compared	to	enterprise	theory,	SET	offers	a	
more	 expansive	 and	 ethically	 grounded	 conception	 of	 accountability,	 one	 that	
reconnects	accounting	practices	with	the	divine	consciousness.	

A	 key	 implication	 of	 SET	 is	 its	 support	 for	 value-added	 statements	 as	 a	
complement	 to	 conventional	 financial	 reports	 in	 Shariah-compliant	 institutions.	
According	to	Baydoun	and	Willet,	value-added	reporting	embodies	full	disclosure	
driven	 by	 moral	 and	 ethical	 awareness.	 This	 practice	 enhances	 managerial	
sensitivity	to	the	ethical	dimensions	of	business	operations	and	fosters	fairer	income	
distribution.	 As	 a	 result,	 the	 adoption	 of	 value-added	 reporting	 signifies	 a	
paradigmatic	 shift	 in	 accounting	 objectives—from	 decision-usefulness	 toward	
social	responsibility	(Musthafa	et	al.,	2020).	

Literature	Review	

Entity	Theory	
Entity	theory	posits	that	a	company	is	a	distinct	and	separate	entity	from	its	

owners.	It	emerged	as	a	response	to	the	limitations	of	proprietary	theory,	which	
centers	the	role	of	the	owner	in	financial	reporting	(Widiyono,	2018).	The	purpose	
of	entity	theory	is	to	establish	clear	boundaries	between	a	company	and	its	owners,	
particularly	 in	 the	 realm	 of	 financial	 recording	 and	 accountability	 (Milatul	 Izza,	
2021).	Under	 this	 framework,	 the	company	 itself	becomes	 the	 focus	of	 financial	
accounting,	rather	than	the	proprietor.	

Although	entity	theory	represents	an	evolution	from	proprietary	theory,	critical	
analyses—especially	those	centered	on	the	concept	of	ownership—highlight	that	
many	of	its	ideological	underpinnings	remain	similar	(Salampessy	&	Juneferstina,	
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2023).	The	theory	emphasizes	the	provision	of	comprehensive	financial	information	
to	capital	owners	for	capital	maintenance	and	the	maximization	of	returns.	

Entity	theory	also	affirms	the	limited	liability	of	company	owners,	distinguishing	
ownership	from	operational	control	(Alifi	&	Wibowo,	2022).	It	holds	that	creditors	
cannot	claim	the	personal	assets	of	owners	 to	cover	company	debts.	Despite	 its	
foundational	 status	 in	modern	 accounting,	 critics	 argue	 that	 entity	 theory	 lacks	
realism	 in	 capturing	 the	 complexities	 of	 business	 relationships.	 Furthermore,	 it	
offers	limited	relevance	for	accounting	practices	in	limited	liability	companies	(Lee	
&	Yeager,	2020).	

As	business	enterprises	are	 increasingly	 seen	as	 social	 institutions	with	 far-
reaching	 impacts,	 a	 broader	 perspective	 is	 warranted.	 The	 theory	 of	 the	 firm	
recognizes	 that	businesses	must	serve	not	only	shareholders	but	also	 the	wider	
array	 of	 stakeholders	whose	well-being	 and	 interests	 are	 affected	 by	 corporate	
actions	(Basriyani	et	al.,	2023).	While	this	perspective	aligns	in	part	with	Shariah	
principles,	it	fails	to	acknowledge	the	economic	rights	of	participants	who	do	not	
contribute	directly—an	omission	that	limits	its	applicability	in	Islamic	accounting	
frameworks	(Widiyono,	2018).		

Enteprise	Theory	
Proprietary	and	entity	theories,	despite	their	historical	contributions,	fall	short	

in	 accommodating	 the	 complexity	 and	 pluralism	 of	modern	 economic	 systems.	
Enterprise	theory	emerged	as	a	more	inclusive	alternative.	According	to	Triyuwono	
(2003),	enterprise	 theory	surpasses	 its	predecessors	 in	scope,	 incorporating	not	
only	economic	but	also	social	dimensions	of	accountability.	Unlike	entity	theory,	
which	 remains	 owner-centric,	 enterprise	 theory	 begins	 to	 introduce	 altruistic	
elements	into	the	accounting	narrative.	

This	theory	focuses	on	all	parties	with	direct	or	indirect	interests	in	a	company’s	
operations—including	 owners,	 management,	 creditors,	 regulators,	 employees,	
customers,	and	society	at	large	(Anggraini	&	Rismadara,	2023).	In	enterprise	theory,	
financial	 information	 must	 serve	 these	 multiple	 stakeholders,	 reflecting	 their	
respective	 contributions	 and	 concerns	 (Gongshan	 et	 al.,	 2020).	 The	 objective	 of	
business	activity,	under	this	model,	is	the	distribution	of	welfare	across	all	related	
stakeholder	groups.	

While	enterprise	theory	aligns	in	spirit	with	many	Shariah	values,	it	does	not	
fully	 acknowledge	 the	 rights	 of	 indirect	 participants—those	 who	 benefit	 from	
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corporate	 existence	 but	 are	 not	 active	 contributors.	 Consequently,	 it	 cannot	 be	
adopted	 as	 a	 complete	 theoretical	 foundation	 for	 Islamic	 accounting	 until	 it	
integrates	these	overlooked	stakeholders	(Pravdiuk	et	al.,	2019).	

Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	
Enterprise	 theory	 is	 regarded	 by	 many	 scholars	 as	 the	 most	 appropriate	

foundation	for	Islamic	accounting	because	it	embraces	key	ethical	values	such	as	
fairness,	 truthfulness,	honesty,	 trustworthiness,	 and	accountability.	These	values	
align	 closely	 with	 the	 characteristics	 of	 Islamic	 accounting	 as	 articulated	 by	
Triyuwono,	 which	 include	 being	 humanistic,	 emancipatory,	 transcendental,	 and	
teleological.	However,	enterprise	theory	remains	influenced	by	secular	paradigms	
such	 as	 agency	 theory	 and	 the	 broader	 politicization	 of	 accounting.	 It	 is	 still	
grounded	in	a	worldly	perspective	and	lacks	the	spiritual	dimension	of	tauhid—the	
concept	of	divine	oneness	central	to	Islamic	worldview	(Meldona	et	al.,	2020).	To	be	
fully	 compatible	 with	 Shariah	 principles,	 this	 theoretical	 framework	 must	
internalize	 the	 value	 of	 tauhid.	 Doing	 so	 provides	 the	 legitimacy	 to	 incorporate	
fundamental	Islamic	concepts	such	as	divine	ownership,	zakat,	divine	justice,	and	
multi-dimensional	accountability.	

According	to	Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	(SET),	stakeholders	are	not	limited	to	
human	actors;	they	encompass	three	categories—God,	human	beings,	and	nature	
(Irawan	 &	 Muarifah,	 2020).	 God	 is	 the	 ultimate	 stakeholder	 and	 the	 highest	
authority	in	the	Shariah	framework.	Placing	God	in	this	role	ensures	that	Islamic	
accounting	 remains	 centered	 on	 fostering	 divine	 awareness	 and	 spiritual	
accountability	among	its	users.	This	theological	foundation	necessitates	that	Islamic	
accounting	be	constructed	solely	on	the	basis	of	sunnatullah,	or	divine	law,	which	
governs	all	principles,	practices,	and	objectives.	In	essence,	Islamic	accounting	must	
be	rooted	in	God’s	regulations,	transcending	mere	human	consensus.	

The	second	stakeholder	group	in	SET	is	humans,	who	are	categorized	as	either	
direct	or	indirect	stakeholders.	Direct	stakeholders	are	those	who	contribute	to	the	
company,	whether	financially	or	through	other	forms	of	input.	As	contributors,	they	
are	 entitled	 to	 a	 share	 in	 the	 benefits	 generated	 by	 the	 company.	 Indirect	
stakeholders,	on	the	other	hand,	are	individuals	who	may	not	contribute	directly	to	
the	company	but,	under	Islamic	law,	still	have	legitimate	rights	to	benefit	from	its	
wealth.	This	perspective	broadens	the	concept	of	entitlement	beyond	conventional	
business	logic,	embedding	it	in	the	ethical	and	social	imperatives	of	Islam.	
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Nature	is	the	third	stakeholder	category.	Like	God	and	human	beings,	nature	
plays	a	vital	role	in	the	existence	and	operation	of	companies.	Firms	are	established	
on	the	earth,	utilize	natural	resources,	derive	energy	from	the	environment,	and	
produce	goods	or	services	using	materials	sourced	from	nature.	However,	unlike	
human	 stakeholders,	 nature	 does	 not	 seek	 monetary	 compensation.	 Instead,	
welfare	distribution	to	nature	involves	the	company's	active	role	in	environmental	
preservation,	sustainability	practices,	and	the	prevention	of	ecological	degradation.	

Triyuwono	(2003)	emphasized	 that	 the	central	axiom	of	Shariah	Enterprise	
Theory	is	the	recognition	that	Allah	is	the	Creator	and	sole	Owner	of	all	resources	in	
the	world.	In	this	view,	human	stakeholders	are	not	true	proprietors	but	trustees,	
and	all	resources	under	their	control	are	divine	trusts.	These	resources	must	be	
utilized	 in	 accordance	with	 the	 guidance	 of	 the	 ultimate	 Owner,	 Allah	 (Samino	
Hendrianto	et	al.,	2022).	This	principle	is	reflected	in	the	Qur’anic	verse	from	Surah	
Al-Baqarah	(2:254):	

	

"O	believers,	spend	(in	the	way	of	Allah)	some	of	the	sustenance	We	have	provided	
for	you	before	 the	Day	comes	when	there	will	be	no	buying	or	 selling,	and	no	
intercession;	and	the	disbelievers	are	the	wrongdoers."	

 
This	verse	has	profound	implications	for	Shariah	Enterprise	Theory,	especially	

in	shaping	its	vision	of	wealth	distribution.	It	implies	that	wealth	carries	embedded	
rights	belonging	to	others,	including	the	poor,	orphans,	travelers	(Ibnu	Sabil),	and	
the	underserved.	Thus,	wealth	or	added	value	should	not	only	be	distributed	among	
direct	participants—such	as	shareholders,	creditors,	employees,	or	governments—
but	 also	 to	 those	 who	 are	 not	 directly	 involved	 in	 business	 operations.	 This	
interpretation	marks	a	significant	departure	from	conventional	enterprise	theory,	
which	 ties	distribution	strictly	 to	contribution.	 In	contrast,	SET	advocates	 for	an	
accounting	framework	that	accounts	for	non-reciprocal	relationships,	where	benefit	
entitlement	 extends	 to	 those	 who	may	 have	 no	 measurable	 input	 but	 possess	
intrinsic	rights	under	Shariah.	This	conceptual	expansion	represents	a	fundamental	
shift	 in	 how	 value	 creation	 and	 distribution	 are	 understood	 within	 Islamic	
accounting	theory.	

Corporate	Social	Responsibility	(CSR)	
Corporate	Social	Responsibility	(CSR)	constitutes	a	key	element	of	corporate	

accountability.	Regardless	of	whether	it	is	mandated	by	regulation	or	not,	companies	
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are	expected	to	engage	in	CSR	activities	within	their	operational	environments	(Ye	
et	al.,	2020).	CSR	represents	a	strategic	approach	that	integrates	social	concern	into	
business	 operations	 and	 stakeholder	 relations,	 guided	 by	 the	 principles	 of	
partnership	 and	 voluntary	 commitment.	 Through	 CSR,	 companies	 acknowledge	
their	role	not	only	as	profit-generating	entities	but	also	as	participants	in	broader	
societal	development.	

One	 influential	 framework	 for	 understanding	CSR	 is	Archie	 Carroll’s	model,	
which	conceptualizes	CSR	as	a	pyramid	comprising	four	interrelated	dimensions.	At	
its	 foundation	 is	 economic	 responsibility,	 which	 positions	 businesses	 as	 vital	
economic	agents	tasked	with	providing	goods	and	services	to	meet	societal	needs	
through	 efficient	 market	 mechanisms.	 Companies	 must	 operate	 profitably	 and	
sustainably	to	fulfill	this	role.	Building	upon	this,	legal	responsibility	refers	to	the	
obligation	 of	 companies	 to	 comply	 with	 applicable	 laws,	 representing	 society’s	
codified	ethical	expectations.	Legal	compliance	 is	 thus	a	baseline	 for	responsible	
corporate	behavior.	

Above	the	legal	level	is	ethical	responsibility,	which	encompasses	actions	and	
decisions	 that	 reflect	principles	of	 fairness,	 justice,	 and	 integrity,	 even	when	not	
legally	required.	Ethical	responsibility	invites	companies	to	consider	societal	values	
and	moral	consequences	 in	their	operations.	Finally,	philanthropic	responsibility	
sits	at	the	top	of	the	pyramid.	This	dimension	reflects	a	company’s	discretionary	
efforts	to	contribute	to	societal	well-being	through	activities	such	as	scholarships,	
donations,	cultural	sponsorships,	and	community	support	programs.	Philanthropy	
enhances	 corporate	 citizenship	 by	 reflecting	 a	 company’s	 compassion	 and	
commitment	to	human	development.	

The	modern	CSR	discourse	can	be	traced	back	to	Western	thought	in	the	mid-
20th	century.	Although	the	concept	gained	momentum	in	the	1970s,	 it	was	first	
introduced	by	Howard	R.	Bowen	in	1953	in	his	book	Social	Responsibilities	of	the	
Businessman.	Bowen	asserted	that	business	leaders	must	pursue	actions	consistent	
with	the	broader	goals	and	values	of	society.	Keith	Davis,	in	his	1973	article	The	Case	
For	and	Against	Business	Assumption	of	Social	Responsibilities	in	the	Academy	of	
Management	Journal,	introduced	the	“Iron	Law	of	Responsibility,”	which	holds	that	
corporations	must	act	responsibly	or	risk	losing	the	power	and	legitimacy	granted	
to	them	by	society.	Both	perspectives	highlight	CSR	as	a	conscious	and	ethical	effort	
to	balance	economic	activity	with	social	welfare.	
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Figure	1.	Archi	Carroll's	Corporate	Social	Responsibility	(CSR)	model	

 

Source:	(Carroll,	2016)	

Central	to	CSR	is	the	need	for	harmony	between	a	company	and	its	stakeholders.	
Stakeholders	encompass	all	parties	who	have	an	interest	in	the	company’s	existence	
and	 performance,	 including	 shareholders,	 employees,	 customers,	 local	
communities,	 and	regulators.	These	groups	 influence	corporate	decision-making	
and	are	also	 impacted	by	the	outcomes	of	business	activities.	As	emphasized	by	
William	C.	Frederick,	Keith	Davis,	and	James	E.	Post	(1988)	in	their	book	Business	
and	 Society:	 Corporate	 Strategy,	 Public	 Policy,	 Ethics,	 CSR	 is	 a	manifestation	 of	
corporate	 concern	 for	 environmental	 protection	 and	 community	 welfare,	
particularly	 in	 the	 context	 of	 the	 areas	where	 companies	 operate	 (Disemadi	 &	
Prananingtyas,	2020).	

An	advanced	theoretical	lens	for	understanding	CSR	is	social	contract	theory,	
which	conceptualizes	business	as	a	 social	 institution	embedded	 in	a	network	of	
mutual	expectations.	According	to	this	theory,	companies	are	bound	to	act	in	ways	
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that	align	with	societal	perceptions	and	values.	These	perceptions	evolve	over	time,	
influenced	by	cultural,	economic,	and	political	factors,	meaning	that	CSR	standards	
can	 differ	 between	 communities	 and	 periods.	 The	 dynamic	 nature	 of	 public	
expectations	 compels	 companies	 to	 continuously	 reassess	 and	 adjust	 their	 CSR	
strategies	to	remain	socially	relevant	(Ye	et	al.,	2020).	

Growing	public	 concern	 for	quality	of	 life,	 environmental	 sustainability,	 and	
social	 equity	has	placed	 greater	pressure	on	businesses	 to	 adopt	 authentic	CSR	
practices.	While	CSR	is	increasingly	being	codified	into	law	and	regulation,	questions	
remain	about	whether	companies	implement	CSR	out	of	genuine	ethical	awareness	
or	 merely	 as	 a	 response	 to	 compliance	 requirements.	 In	 practice,	 many	 CSR	
initiatives	are	sporadic	or	symbolic,	failing	to	deliver	substantive	benefits	to	society.	
Therefore,	a	shift	toward	more	thoughtful,	needs-based,	and	community-engaged	
CSR	 strategies	 is	 essential	 to	 realizing	 the	 transformative	potential	 of	 corporate	
responsibility.	

Sustainability	Reporting	
In	the	context	of	sustainability,	corporate	responsibility	is	no	longer	limited	to	

single-bottom-line	(SBL)	considerations	such	as	profit	or	enterprise	value,	which	
focus	solely	on	business	and	economic	conditions.	Instead,	it	encompasses	the	Triple	
Bottom	Line	(TBL)	approach,	which	 integrates	 three	key	dimensions:	economic,	
social,	and	environmental—commonly	referred	to	as	the	3Ps:	Profit,	People,	and	
Planet.	 These	 three	 elements	 form	 the	 foundation	 of	 sustainable	 development.	
Information	 pertaining	 to	 these	 dimensions	 is	 typically	 presented	 in	 a	 separate	
document	 from	 the	company’s	 financial	 statements,	known	as	 the	 sustainability	
report	 (Febriyanti,	 2021).	 According	 to	 the	 Global	 Reporting	 Initiative	 (2016),	
sustainability	 reporting	 is	 defined	 as	 the	 public	 disclosure	 of	 an	 organization’s	
economic,	environmental,	and	social	impacts,	including	both	positive	and	negative	
contributions	to	its	sustainability	goals.	

The	 Indonesian	Financial	Accounting	Standards	Board,	 in	paragraph	9	of	 its	
Statement	on	Financial	Accounting	Standards	(PSAK)	No.	1,	implicitly	encourages	
companies	 to	 disclose	 environmental	 and	 social	 responsibility	matters	 through	
environmental	 and	value-added	 reports	 (Ikatan	Akuntan	 Indonesia,	 2015).	This	
form	of	disclosure	has	become	a	significant	obligation,	particularly	for	publicly	listed	
companies	(Bukhori	&	Sopian,	2017).	

Over	the	past	two	decades,	numerous	sustainability	reporting	frameworks	have	
been	adopted	 in	business,	particularly	among	multinational	enterprises	 (MNEs).	
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One	 of	 the	 most	 widely	 recognized	 is	 the	 Global	 Reporting	 Initiative	 (GRI).	
Established	in	1997	and	headquartered	in	the	Netherlands,	GRI	is	an	independent	
international	organization	that	has	played	a	pioneering	role	in	the	development	of	
sustainability	reporting	standards.	GRI	seeks	to	assist	businesses	and	governments	
worldwide	 in	 addressing	 sustainable	 development	 challenges,	 including	 social	
equity	and	human	welfare	(Hardi	&	Chairina,	2019).	

Methods	

This	 study	adopts	a	qualitative	 research	design	grounded	 in	an	 interpretive	
paradigm.	The	data	used	in	this	research	are	secondary	in	nature	(Zaluchu,	2020).	
Secondary	data	sources	include	findings	from	previous	studies	and	scholarly	works	
deemed	relevant	to	the	research	objectives.	Data	collection	techniques	consist	of	a	
structured	literature	review	and	online	searches	aimed	at	identifying	theoretical	and	
empirical	references	pertinent	to	the	topic.	

The	research	process	is	supported	by	various	instruments	that	facilitate	data	
gathering	 and	 analysis.	 These	 include	 writing	 tools	 and	 digital	 devices	 such	 as	
mobile	phones,	 laptops,	and	 internet	access.	These	tools	assist	 the	researcher	 in	
capturing,	organizing,	and	analyzing	data.	

Data	analysis	in	this	study	follows	a	three-stage	process:	data	reduction,	data	
presentation,	and	conclusion	drawing,	in	line	with	the	approach	suggested	by	Yosep	
et	al.	(2020).	Data	reduction	involves	selecting	and	simplifying	relevant	information;	
data	presentation	entails	osrganizing	the	information	in	a	coherent	format;	and	the	
final	stage	involves	interpreting	the	data	to	draw	meaningful	conclusions.		

Result	and	Discussions	

Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	in	CSR	Disclosure	
Enterprise	Theory	 is	built	on	 the	understanding	 that	economic	power	 is	no	

longer	concentrated	in	the	hands	of	a	single	entity	but	is	instead	distributed	among	
various	 stakeholders.	 This	 decentralization	 aligns	 closely	with	 Sharia	 principles,	
which	 prohibit	 the	 accumulation	 and	 circulation	 of	 wealth	 within	 only	 certain	
groups	(Pramiana	&	Anisah,	2018).	Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	(SET)	extends	the	
concern	 for	 responsibility	 beyond	 individual	 interests—such	 as	 those	 of	
shareholders—to	 encompass	 a	 broader	 range	 of	 stakeholders,	 including	 Allah,	
human	 beings,	 and	 nature.	 Allah	 is	 regarded	 as	 the	 highest	 authority	 and	 the	
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ultimate	purpose	of	human	existence,	thereby	occupying	the	role	of	the	supreme	
stakeholder	in	the	Shariah	framework	(Ruddin,	2018).	

In	this	view,	social	responsibility	disclosures	are	not	merely	administrative	or	
reputational	exercises	but	are	acts	of	spiritual	accountability.	First,	the	expression	of	
social	responsibility	is	framed	as	a	form	of	human	accountability	to	God,	with	the	
ultimate	aim	of	earning	divine	approval.	Second,	these	disclosures	serve	to	inform	
all	stakeholders—direct,	indirect,	and	environmental—about	the	extent	to	which	an	
institution	has	fulfilled	its	obligations.	Third,	from	the	perspective	of	Islamic	banking,	
CSR	disclosure	 is	not	optional;	 it	 is	a	requirement	and	a	 tool	 to	achieve	Shariah	
objectives.	Furthermore,	CSR	disclosures	must	capture	both	material	and	spiritual	
dimensions	 relevant	 to	 stakeholders’	 interests	 and	 include	 both	 qualitative	 and	
quantitative	information	(Pramiana	&	Anisah,	2018).	

SET	 distinguishes	 between	 two	 key	 dimensions	 of	 accountability	 in	 CSR	
disclosure:	vertical	and	horizontal	accountability	(Novarela	&	Sari,	2019).	Vertical	
accountability	is	directed	exclusively	toward	Allah	and	includes	disclosures	such	as	
the	opinions	of	the	Shariah	Supervisory	Board	and	statements	of	compliance	or	non-
compliance	 with	 Islamic	 legal	 rulings	 (fatwas),	 along	 with	 their	 justifications.	
Horizontal	accountability,	on	the	other	hand,	is	directed	toward	three	groups:	direct	
stakeholders,	 indirect	 stakeholders,	 and	 the	 environment.	 Direct	 stakeholders	
typically	include	employees	and	customers,	while	indirect	stakeholders	refer	to	the	
broader	 community,	 who	 may	 not	 contribute	 directly	 to	 the	 business	 but	 are	
nonetheless	affected	by	its	operations	(Mu’alifah	et	al.,	2024).	

Allah,	 as	 the	 supreme	 stakeholder,	 serves	 as	 the	moral	 and	 spiritual	 axis	of	
Islamic	 accounting.	 By	 placing	 Allah	 in	 this	 position,	 a	 vital	 link	 is	 established	
between	 Islamic	 accounting	 and	 the	 broader	 economic	 system	 (Nurbaeta	 et	 al.,	
2024).	If	the	economic	system	remains	oriented	toward	increasing	awareness	of	
God	 among	 its	 users,	 it	 is	 expected	 that	 harmful	 behavior—toward	 oneself	 or	
others—can	be	avoided,	as	it	would	contradict	divine	commands.	The	role	of	Allah	
as	the	ultimate	stakeholder	is	operationalized	through	sunnatullah,	which	serves	as	
the	 foundation	 for	 constructing	 Islamic	 accounting	 systems.	 In	 this	 context,	
sunnatullah	 accounting	 refers	 to	 an	 accounting	 model	 developed	 strictly	 in	
accordance	with	divine	laws	and	principles.	

The	second	major	stakeholder	in	SET	is	the	human	being,	who	is	divided	into	
two	categories:	direct	and	indirect	stakeholders.	Direct	stakeholders	are	individuals	
who	contribute	directly	to	the	business,	either	financially	or	through	other	means.	
Because	of	their	contributions,	they	are	entitled	to	receive	social	benefits	from	the	
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company.	 Indirect	 stakeholders,	while	 not	 directly	 involved	 in	 the	business,	 are	
nonetheless	 entitled	 to	 receive	 assistance	 in	 accordance	 with	 Shariah	 law—
especially	in	the	form	of	social	financial	support	(Triyuwono,	2003).	Both	direct	and	
indirect	 stakeholders	 have	 legitimate	 claims	 to	 the	well-being	 generated	 by	 the	
business	and	must	not	be	harmed	by	its	operations.	

Nature	constitutes	the	third	essential	stakeholder	in	SET.	Nature	is	regarded	as	
playing	a	crucial	role	in	the	existence	of	companies,	 just	as	God	and	humans	do.	
Businesses	 operate	 by	 utilizing	 natural	 resources:	 they	 are	 established	 on	 land,	
consume	energy	from	the	environment,	and	depend	on	raw	materials	provided	by	
the	Earth.	However,	unlike	human	stakeholders,	nature	does	not	seek	monetary	
gain.	 Instead,	 the	 concept	 of	 welfare	 for	 nature	 involves	 corporate	 concern	 for	
environmental	 sustainability,	 including	 pollution	 prevention	 and	 ecosystem	
preservation		(Triyuwono,	2003).	In	this	framework,	Allah	is	seen	as	the	ultimate	
guardian,	 and	 all	 resources	 entrusted	 to	 human	 stakeholders	 must	 be	 used	 in	
accordance	with	divine	mandates,	with	the	aim	of	achieving	objectives	defined	by	
the	most	trustworthy	authority—Allah	Himself.	

Corporate	Social	Responsibility:	Towards	Sustainability	Reporting	
The	 concept	 of	 sustainability,	 particularly	 the	 Triple	 Bottom	 Line	 (TBL)	

approach—encompassing	GRI	200	(economic),	GRI	300	(environmental),	and	GRI	
400	(social)	standards—is	more	closely	aligned	with	Islamic	teachings	than	with	
capitalist	ideologies.	Capitalism	is	often	materialistic	and	tends	to	neglect	spiritual	
principles,	 including	 the	 well-being	 of	 society	 and	 the	 preservation	 of	 the	
environment.	 In	 contrast,	 Islam	 emphasizes	 obedience	 to	 Allah	 SWT	 as	 the	
foundation	of	human	existence.	This	obedience	brings	blessings	(barakah)	in	this	life	
and	 serves	 as	 a	 form	 of	 sustenance	 for	 the	 afterlife,	 underscoring	 a	 form	 of	
sustainability	 that	 extends	 beyond	worldly	 life.	When	 applied	 to	 the	 concept	 of	
Shariah	sustainability	reporting	and	accounting,	the	core	objectives	of	compliance	
are	 framed	 through	 two	principles:	accountability	and	 introspection	 (Cendika	&	
Sawarjuwono,	2021).	

Accountability	 is	 understood	 as	 the	 responsibility	 of	 humans	 as	 stewards	
(khalifah)	on	Earth.	As	stated	in	Surah	An-Nisa	(4:85):	

	

"Whoever	provides	suitable	mediation	will	receive	a	share	(reward)	from	it.	And	
whoever	intercedes	for	bad	things	will	bear	his	share	(sin).	Allah	is	Almighty	over	
everything."	
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This	 verse	 illustrates	 the	 Islamic	 emphasis	 on	 the	 consequences	 of	 human	
actions	 and	 the	 imperative	 to	 ensure	 that	 one’s	 conduct	 aligns	 with	 divine	
expectations.	In	the	context	of	sustainability	reporting,	this	accountability	translates	
into	 the	 need	 for	 organizations	 to	 report	 transparently	 on	 their	 economic,	
environmental,	and	social	impacts	as	part	of	their	duty	to	both	society	and	Allah.	

Introspection	 is	 equally	 essential.	 Although	 humans	 may	 strive	 to	 act	
righteously,	they	are	prone	to	error.	Self-reflection	is	encouraged	so	individuals	and	
organizations	can	recognize	shortcomings	and	commit	to	continual	improvement.	
Numerous	verses	support	this	view,	including	Surah	Al-Baqarah	(2:160):	

	

"Except	those	who	repent	after	(disbelief)	and	make	amends.	For	indeed,	Allah	is	
Forgiving,	Most	Merciful."	
 
Islam	encourages	ongoing	reform,	and	those	who	fail	to	make	improvements	

are	deemed	transgressors,	as	mentioned	in	Surah	Ash-Shu'ara	(26:151–152)	and	
An-Naml	(27:47–48).	In	sustainability	reporting,	introspection	aligns	with	the	goal	
of	 minimizing	 harm,	 preserving	 resources,	 and	 ensuring	 the	 longevity	 of	 both	
society	and	the	environment.	

Implementing	 TBL	 reporting	 enables	 organizations	 to	 communicate	 their	
sustainability	efforts	transparently,	allowing	stakeholders	to	assess	their	financial	
stability,	environmental	responsibility,	and	social	accountability.	A	truly	sustainable	
organization	is	one	that	ensures	its	profitability	while	minimizing	environmental	
harm	and	responding	to	the	social	expectations	of	the	communities	it	affects.	The	
reporting	process	thus	becomes	a	mechanism	of	accountability	to	all	stakeholders	
and	a	reflection	of	the	organization’s	ethical	commitments	(Rofelawaty,	2014).	

According	to	the	Sustainability	Reporting	Guidelines,	a	complete	sustainability	
report	 should	 contain	 three	 key	 types	 of	 disclosures.	 First,	 Strategic	 and	
Organizational	Profiles	provide	an	overview	of	the	organization’s	goals,	governance	
structure,	and	operational	context.	Second,	the	Management	Approach	explains	the	
policies,	strategies,	and	procedures	used	to	manage	performance	in	specific	areas,	
offering	insight	into	how	sustainability	principles	are	embedded	in	daily	operations.	
Third,	 the	 Performance	 Index	 includes	 measurable	 indicators	 related	 to	 the	
organization’s	 economic,	 environmental,	 and	 social	 performance,	 enabling	
comparisons	over	time	and	across	organizations	(Rofelawaty,	2014).	
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To	fulfill	these	requirements,	researchers	must	evaluate	and	extract	relevant	
information	 from	 corporate	 sustainability	 or	 annual	 reports	 using	 a	 systematic	
content	analysis	approach.	The	disclosure	 items	are	organized	 into	seven	major	
categories.	 The	 General	 Information	 section	 includes	 brief	 descriptions	 of	 the	
organization’s	 identity,	strategic	goals	(short-,	medium-,	and	long-term),	and	any	
awards	 or	 recognitions	 received.	 The	 Economic	 Index	 captures	 financial	
performance,	market	share,	and	the	indirect	economic	impacts	of	the	company’s	
activities.	The	Environmental	Indicators	assess	resource	usage	(materials,	energy,	
water),	efforts	toward	biodiversity	preservation,	waste	and	emissions	management,	
product	 safety,	 environmental	 compliance,	 and	 the	 adoption	 of	 sustainable	
technologies.	

The	Social	Index	evaluates	employment	practices,	workplace	health	and	safety,	
equal	opportunity	policies,	training	and	education	provisions,	and	gender	equity.	
The	 Human	 Rights	 Index	 covers	 issues	 such	 as	 investment	 and	 procurement	
practices,	 discrimination,	 labor	 rights	 (including	 freedom	 of	 association	 and	
protection	from	forced	labor),	indigenous	rights,	and	grievance	mechanisms.	The	
Socio-Community	 Index	 explores	 the	 company’s	 relationship	 with	 local	
communities,	 anti-corruption	 initiatives,	 public	 policy	 engagement,	 anti-
competitive	 behavior,	 and	 adherence	 to	 public	 regulations.	 Lastly,	 the	 Product	
Liability	Index	includes	disclosures	on	product	safety,	labeling,	marketing	practices,	
consumer	 privacy,	 and	 legal	 compliance	 in	 relation	 to	 products	 and	 services	
(Rofelawaty,	2014).	

Conclusion	

Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	is	a	conceptual	framework	based	on	the	belief	that	
corporate	social	responsibility	(CSR)	extends	beyond	obligations	to	shareholders	or	
economic	 stakeholders.	 It	 emphasizes	 broader	 accountability,	 including	
responsibilities	 toward	 Allah	 SWT—the	 ultimate	 owner	 and	 sovereign	 of	 all	
resources.	This	theory	asserts	that	a	company's	actions	must	be	aligned	not	only	
with	the	interests	of	humans	and	the	environment	but	also	with	divine	expectations.	
By	 positioning	 Allah	 as	 the	 highest	 stakeholder,	 Shariah	 Enterprise	 Theory	
introduces	a	spiritually	grounded	orientation	to	corporate	responsibility,	wherein	
ethical	conduct	and	transparency	are	acts	of	worship	and	obedience.	

The	 emergence	 of	 sustainability	 reporting	 and	 Shariah-based	 accounting	
reflects	an	evolving	desire	among	economic	institutions	to	enhance	accountability	
by	incorporating	ethical,	social,	environmental,	and	governance	aspects	alongside	
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traditional	financial	metrics.	CSR	reporting,	particularly	in	the	form	of	sustainability	
reports,	 is	 intended	 to	 provide	 continuous	 and	 comprehensive	 disclosure	 of	 an	
organization’s	 responsibilities	 and	 initiatives.	 These	 reports	 should	 adhere	 to	
established	standards	and	frameworks	to	ensure	that	the	information	presented	is	
meaningful,	comparable,	and	relevant	to	stakeholders.	Shariah	Enterprise	Theory,	
when	integrated	into	such	reporting,	offers	a	more	holistic	accountability	model	that	
prioritizes	not	only	regulatory	compliance	and	social	 impact	but	also	moral	and	
spiritual	integrity.	

In	conclusion,	Shariah	Enterprise	Theory	can	serve	as	a	powerful	foundation	for	
rethinking	CSR	in	a	way	that	aligns	with	Islamic	ethical	principles	and	the	objectives	
of	sustainable	development.	 It	offers	a	multidimensional	approach	that	balances	
profit	with	purpose	and	material	responsibility	with	spiritual	consciousness.	

Further	research	is	encouraged	to	examine	the	practical	application	of	Shariah	
Enterprise	Theory	within	corporate	CSR	reporting,	especially	through	case	studies	
conducted	 directly	 at	 companies.	 This	 would	 allow	 researchers	 to	 assess	 how	
effectively	the	theory	is	being	implemented	in	real-world	contexts	and	to	identify	
best	practices,	challenges,	and	opportunities	for	refinement.	Future	studies	could	
also	compare	conventional	sustainability	frameworks	with	Shariah-based	models	to	
evaluate	their	relative	impacts	on	corporate	ethics	and	stakeholder	trust.	
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